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The Carmel Valley Association (CVA) works with residents, businesses and

government agencies to preserve the rural nature of Carmel Valley. Inevitably, that goal

has guided CVA’s efforts to preserve and celebrate our naturally dark and starry skies. Through 
community education and adoption of simple best practices for outdoor lighting, CVA seeks to

reduce excessive nighttime lighting that spills glare into the community and obscures

our treasured night sky. In many cases, simply turning off lights at night by timer or motion 
sensor can meet these goals.


CVA’s long-term effort has taken many forms, ranging from working toward recognition of

Garland Ranch Regional Park as a Dark Sky Place or Reserve under the auspices of Dark Sky 
International (DSI) to the installation of dark-sky-friendly lighting fixtures in local areas. Our 
work intends to ensure that the Carmel Valley doesn’t lose its naturally dark and starry skies. 
The encroachment of light pollution from more developed urban areas is striking.


This image from a Light Pollution Map demonstrates the intense night lighting to our north 
(Monterey, Seaside, and Marina) and northeast (Salinas) contrasted with the relatively dark 
areas of Carmel Valley, Carmel Highlands, and Big Sur.


https://www.mprpd.org/garland-ranch-regional-park
https://darksky.org/what-we-do/international-dark-sky-places/
https://darksky.org/what-we-do/international-dark-sky-places/
https://www.lightpollutionmap.info/#zoom=8.55&lat=36.4578&lon=-121.3057&state=eyJiYXNlbWFwIjoiTGF5ZXJCaW5nUm9hZCIsIm92ZXJsYXkiOiJ3YV8yMDE1Iiwib3ZlcmxheWNvbG9yIjpmYWxzZSwib3ZlcmxheW9wYWNpdHkiOjYwLCJmZWF0dXJlc29wYWNpdHkiOjg1fQ==
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CVA can’t do this important work alone. A new and exciting collaboration with Hartnell College

is a central element of CVA’s Dark Sky initiative. Begun in summer 2023, this collaboration

provides funding, guidance, and hands-on experiences for students and CVA to learn about 
how light pollution affects humans, animals, and communities. 


The 2024 Dark Sky Intern, Jonathan Herrera, is documenting levels of incident light and dark 
sky quality at many locations throughout the Carmel Valley from the Village to the mouth of the 
Valley. His science-based evidence will help us to develop an analysis of how excessive 
lighting can be mitigated and managed to preserve our starry night skies.


Last summer the Hartnell intern, Julie San Pablo, helped to establish CVA’s relations with DSI, 
attended Regional Park Board meetings, inventoried exterior lighting in Carmel Valley Village 
and at the Garland Ranch Regional Park buildings, and facilitated and publicized a star gazing 
party at Hidden Valley Music Seminars with the Monterey Institute for Research in Astronomy 
(MIRA)’s help providing instruments and volunteer stargazing guides. 


Each summer intern presents a poster on their work at a STEM Fair held the second Saturday 
in September at Hartnell College, further spreading concepts of sensible lighting and dark sky 
preservation.


CVA also teamed up with Friends of the Carmel Valley Library, Monterey Lighting, and several 
local HOAs to provide forums to advocate for low impact lighting and best exterior lighting 
practices. Monterey County Board of Supervisors recognized international Dark Sky Week in a 
proclamation sponsored by Mary Adams, our 5th District Supervisor. 


Through these ever-expanding efforts, CVA and its local partners hope to keep our shared 
natural heritage Dark and Starry.


Additional Photographs:


2023 Intern & Hartnell Professor Dr. Pimol	 	 John Heyl of CVA receives Dark Sky Week 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 recognition from Supervisor Mary Adams
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